G.S.R.161:-
In exercise of the powers conferred by section 7 of the Indian Telegraph Act, 1885 (13 of 1885), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Indian Wireless Telegraphy (Commercial Radio Operators’ Certificates of Proficiency and Licence to operate Wireless Telegraphy) Rules, 1954, namely:-

1. (1) These rules may be called the Indian Wireless Telegraphy (Commercial Radio Operators’ Certificates of Proficiency and Licence to operate Wireless Telegraphy) Amendment rules, 1988.

(2) They shall come into force with effect from the 1st day of April, 1988.

2. In the Indian Wireless Telegraphy (Commercial Radio Operators’ Certificates of Proficiency and Licence to operate Wireless Telegraphy) Rules, 1954 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules).  Against clauses (i) to (iv) of rule 7 for the word and figures “Rs.20.00” wherever they occur, the word and figures “Rs.50.00” shall be substituted._

3. In clause (i) of sub-rule (1) of rule 10 of the said rules for the word and figures “Rs.15” the word and figures “Rs.50” shall be substituted.

4. In rules 10A of the said rules, for the word and figures “Rs.5”, the word and figures, “Rs.15” shall be substituted.

5. For sub-rule (2) of rule 11 of the said rules, the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:-

“(2) The Central Government may issue a duplicate copy of any certificate or licence or document showing the renewal if licence on payment of following charges:-

(a) for duplicate copy of certificate or licence or both    : Rs.50


(b) for duplicate copy of document showing renewal of licence   : Rs.25.







(No.R-11014/4/97-LR



   


T.C.Gupta, Asstt.Wireless Advisor

